

FOI Request 1743

NHS Redditch and Bromsgrove CCG

For each Clinical Commissioning Group for which you are responsible for answering Freedom of Information Requests, I would like to know the following:

1.

- The name of the organisation managing FOI requests **Arden Commissioning Support**
- the number of FOI requests received in the first three months of the current financial year **39**
- the name & email address of the FOI Officer **FOI Team** foi@ardencsu.nhs.uk

the name of the computer system used to record FOI / SAR Requests, the name of the computer system supplier, the expiry date of the current contract and the annual cost of the computer system
The CCG does not hold this information

2. The total forecast expenditure during the current 2013/14 financial year on patient placements within the following patient groups: Continuing Healthcare & Funded Nursing Care; Mental Health (excluding patients now managed by the National Commissioning Board) and Children.

Older People	1,295,299
Terminal Care	721,602
Mental Health	220,498
EMI	1,321,452
YPD	1,590,702
Learning Diffs	1,896,782
Equipment	900
Total	7,047,234

3. The names, email addresses and telephone numbers of the Responsible Officer for each area in question 2 and the name of the organisation managing each area.

Simon Hairsnape (see response to Q5 below)

4. The Name, Annual Cost and Supplier Name of any computer systems used to record this data for each area in question 2, along with the expiry date of the current contract.

The CCG does not hold this information

5. The email addresses of the CEO, Director of Finance and Director of Commissioning for each CCG;

Chief Officer – Simon Hairsnape

Chief Finance Officer – Mary Walters

Head of Commissioning and Service Redesign – Christina Emerson

Please use the 'contact us' facility for all enquiries

<http://www.redditchandbromsgroveccg.nhs.uk/contact-us/>

6. Relative to other CCG's in the country, would you estimate that the CCG is small, medium or large?

This is not recorded information. Please see the CCG website for details on the number of GP practices and population size.

<http://www.redditchandbromsgroveccg.nhs.uk/about-us/>